IN THE TASMANIAN INDUSTRIAL COMMISSION

Industrial Relations Act 1984

T.266 of 1985 IN THE MATTER OF AN

APPLICATION BY THE TASMANIAN
TRADES AND LABOR COUNCIL TO
VARY WAGE RATES AND ALLOWANCES
IN NOMINATED PUBLIC  AND
PRIVATE SECTOR  AWARDS IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE NATIONAL
WAGE CASE DECISION OF 4
NOVEMBER 1985

ORDER BY CONSENT :

No. 2 of 1985

AMEND THE SHIPBUILDERS AWARD, PART II -~ CONDITIONS, IN THE FOLLOWING
MANNER :

2.

3.

b

P063

Seetion I = Clause 1 = Special Rates = by amending as follows:

(a) Delete "28 cents” and insert "29 cents”.

(b) Delete "35 cents” and insert "36 cents”.

(e) (i) Delete "28 cents” and insert "29 cents".
(ii) Delete "73 cents" and insert "76 cents”.

(d) Delete "28 cents"” and insert "29 cents”.

(e) Delete "25 cents” and insert "26 cents”.

Section I - Clause 7 - by deleting the amount "§$4.50"
appearing in sub-clause (d) and inserting in lieu thereof
”sqo 70",

Section I - Clause 11 - Travelling Time - by deleting the
amount "26 cents" appearing in sub-clause (b) and inserting in
lieu thereof "27 cents".

Section I — Clause 12 - Distant Jobs - by deleting the amount
"$2.60" and inserting in lieu thereof "$2.70".

-1 =



10.

Section II - Clause 2 - Special Rates - by amending as
follows:

(a) Delete "28 cents” and insert "29 cents".

(b) Delete "35 cents" and insert "36 cents".

(e) (i) Delete "28 cents" and insert "29 cents".
(ii) Delete "73 cents" and insert "76 cents".

(d) Delete "28 cents” and insert "29 cents”.

(e) Delete “25 cents"” and insert “26 cents".

Section II - Clause 3 — Disability Allowance - by deleting the
amount "$12.20" and inserting in lieu thereof "$12.70".

Section II - Clause 8 - Overtime - by deleting the amount
“$4.50" and inserting in lieu thereof "$4.70".

Section II - Clause 14 - Tools - by deleting the amount
"610.40" and inserting in lieu thereof "$10.80".

Section II - Clause 15 - Travelling Time = by deleting the
amount "26 cents” appearing in sub-clause (b) and inserting in
lieu thereof "27 cents”.

Section II - Clause 16 - Distant Jobs - by deleting the amount
"$2.70" and inserting in lieu thereof "$2.80".

The foregoing variations shall have effect from the first pay period
commencing on or after 4 November 1985.

Provided that, it is a term of this award that the unions undertake
that they will not pursue any extra claims, award or overaward,
except where consistent with the Principles of Wage Fixation of the
Tasmanian Industrial Commission.




