IN THE TASMANIAN INDUSTRIAL COMMISSION

Industrial Relations Act 1984

T. No. 99 of 1985 IN THE MATTER OF an application by

the Tasmanian Trades and Labor
Council to increase salaries and
allowances in the AWARD OF THE
SHIPEBUILDERS  INDUSTRIAL BOARD in
accordance with the National Wage
Case decision of 3 April 1985

ORDER BY CONSENT -

The above award is varied as follows:

PART II - CONDITIONS

1.

By deleting the title of the award and inserting in lieu
thereof “Shipbuilders Award".

Section I - Clause 1 - Special Rates - by amending as
follows:

(a) Delete "27 cents" and insert "28 cents".
(b) Delete "34 cents" and insert "35 cents".
(c)(i) Delete "27 cents" and insert "28 cents".
(ii) Delete "71 cents" and insert "73 cents".
(d) Delete "27 cents" and insert "28 cents".
(e) Delete "24 cents" and insert "25 cents".

Section I - Clause 7 - by deleting the amount "$4.40"
appearing in sub-clause (d) and inserting in lieu thereof
|t$4.50n.

Section I - Clause 11 - Travelling Time - by deleting the
amount "25 cents" appearing in sub-clause (b) and inserting
in lieu thereof "26 cents".



10.

11.

Section I — Clause 12 - Distant Jobs - by deleting the amount
“$2.50" and inserting in lieu thereof "$2.60".

Section II - Clause 2 - Special Rates — by amending as
follows:

{a) Delete "27 cents" and insert "28B cents".
(b) Delete "34 cents" and insert "35 cents".
(c)(i) Delete "27 cents" and insert "28 cents".
(ii) Delete "71 cents" and insert "73 cents".
(d) Delete "27 cents" and insert "28 cents".
(e) Delete "24 cents" and insert "25 cents".

Section II - Clause 3 - Disability Allowance - by deleting
the amount "$11.90" and inserting in lieu thereof "$12.20".

Section II - Clause 8 — Overtime - by deleting the amount
"$4.40" and inserting in lieu thereof "$4.50".

Section II - Clause 14 = Tools - by deleting the amount
"$10.10" and inserting in lieu thereof "$10.40".

Section II - Clause 15 - Travelling Time - by deleting the
amount "25 cents" appearing in sub-clause (b) and inserting
in lieu thereof "26 cents".

Section II - Clause 16 - Distant Jobs - by deleting the
amount "$2.60" and inserting in lieu thereof "$2.70".

The foregoing variations shall have effect from the first pay period
camencing on or after 6 April 1985.




